021-13 Solid Waste Containers

Bid Schedule | Steel Containers

] e Otto IES Sales ]
Rehig Pacific . Nedland Iron . Wastequip Nuwave
Company Environmental Industries Container and Service Mfg Container
Systems LLC
Item | Description Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
1 8yd3 Containers
A. Plastic side doors, flat top no bid no bid no bid S 750.00|$ 749.95(S 759.00 |no bid
B. Steel side doors, flat top no bid no bid no bid S 75000 S 74495 (S 784.00 |no bid
C. Plastic side door, slanttop  [no bid no bid no bid S 730.00|$ 73995(S 770.00 |no bid
D Steel side doors, slant top no bid no bid no bid S 73000 (S 734.95 |no bid no bid
2 |6 yd3 Containers
A. Plastic side doors, flat top no bid no bid no bid S 655.00(S 629.29|S 674.00 [no bid
B. Steel side doors, flat top no bid no bid no bid S 655.00|S8 624958 699.00 |no bid
C. Plastic side door, slant top no bid no bid no bid S 62500(S 629.95]|S 654.00 [no bid
D Steel side doors, slant top no bid no bid no bid S 625.00 | S 624.95 |no bid no bid
3 |4 yd3 Containers
A. Plastic side doors, flat top no bid no bid no bid S 50000 (S 519.95]|S 522.00 [no bid
B. Steel side doors, flat top no bid no bid no bid S 500008 514958 535.00 |no bid
4 |2 yd3 Containers
a. Flat top-no caster no bid no bid no bid S 34500 |S8 324958 395.00 |no bid
State Minimum Order none none none None Truckload none none
Delivery N/A N/A N/A 30 days S 21.00 |30 days N/A
No doors on
Notes Slant




Schedule Il Plastic Containers

Rehig Pacific ) Otto Nedland Iron IES Sale.s Wastequip Nuwave
Environmental ) ] and Service ]
Company Industries Container Mfg Container
Systems LLC
Item | Description Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
1 4yd3 Containers
a. no casters S 758.00 | $§ 912.27 | $  856.00 [no bid no bid S 643.50 | § 775.00
b. with caster S 778.00 | S 937.27 | S  856.00 |no bid no bid S 732.60 | S 795.00
2 |2 yd3 Containers
a. no casters S 560.00 | S 467.26 | §  656.00 |no bid no bid no bid S 537.00
b. with caster S 580.00 | § 492.26 [ S  656.00 |no bid no bid S 470.25 [ S 557.00
State Minimum Order 1 truckload full truckload 5[none none truckload truckload
delivery 30 days 4-6 weeks 2-4 weeks N/A N/A 6-8 weeks 20 days
All costs are

Notes

plus freight




